City of Conway, Arkansas Office of the M&)’OI" Number of Bids Received - 2

Mayor’s Office : . :

1201 Oak Street City of Conway Opened by: Ronnie Hall
Conway, AR 72032 Bid Tabulation Sheet

501.450.61 10 (office) ,

501.450.6145 (fax) www.cityofconway.org

Bid Number: 2015-07— Annual Bid_Pavement Markings Bid Tabulation

Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, December 15t, 2015 @ 10:00am

Pavement Markings - The bids submitted for Pavement Markings included a minimum project cost.

Our usual pavement marking project may not support the minimum project amount submitted. Thus, we request that the amounts submitted for
the pavement marking items be considered quotes. Additional quotes or additional negotiations may be considered when specific pavement
marking work is needed. The workload and availability of the contractor along with the details of a specific project may result in a more competitive
price and/or a different minimum amount. The low quotes submitted are as follows:

Pavement Marking:

4” White Refl. Paint Time Striping $0.20/ Foot

4” Yellow Refl. Paint Time Striping $0.20/ Foot

6” White Refl. Paint Ark Line Marking $0.50/ Foot

6” Yellow Refl. Paint Ark Line Marking $0.50/ Foot

No bid winners

Bid Quotes were approved by City Council on Tuesday, December 2204, 2015.

For additional information regarding this bid; please contact Finley Vinson @ finley.vinson@cityofconway.org or 501.450.6165.



mailto:finley.vinson@cityofconway.org
http://www.cityofconway.org/

CITY OF CONWAY

SUMMARY OF ANNUAL BIDS FOR STREET DEPARTMENT TYPE WORK
FOR YEAR 2016

Bids Opened December 15, 2015

GRAVEL ROGERS GROUP WEBCO Hamilton Aggregates 2015 LOW BID
CRUSHED STONE FOB PLANT $8.56 /TON (Gbr) $7.56 /TON(EI Paso $8.65 /TON $8.05 /TON
CRUSHED STONE DELIVERED TO STREET DEPT. $13.10 /TON $13.10 /TON $13.33 /TON $12.57 /TON
BALLAST STONE DELIVERED TO STREET DEPT. $13.64 /TON $13.75 /TON $14.41 /TON $13.75 /TON
STONE BACKFILL DELIVERED TO STREET DEPT. $13.39 /TON $12.99 /TON $13.33 /TON $12.99 /TON
RIPRAP DELIVERED TO STREET DEPARTMENT $20.60 /TON $18.62 /TON $ 20.95 /TON $ 18.62 /TON

CONCRETE MALLARD ARGOS 2015 LOW BID
CLASS A CONCRETE $92.55 /C.Y. $93.52 /C.Y. $84.43 /C.Y.

CLASS S CONCRETE $99.05 /C.Y. $100.05 /C.Y. $87.00 /C.Y.
1% ADDED CALCIUM $4.00 /C.Y. $5.25 /C.Y. $4.00 /C.Y.

CONCRETE PIPE: SIZE Scurlock Forterra Pipe & Precast Drainage Pipe, LLC 2015 LOW BID

12" $8.30 /FOOT $9.90 /FOOT $10.67 /FOOT $8.15 /FOOT

15" $11.00 /FOOT $12.10 /FOOT $13.20 /FOOT $11.35 /FOOT

18" $11.50 /FOOT $14.70 /FOOT $16.00 /FOOT $13.16 /FOOT

24" $18.75 /[FOOT $23.30 /FOOT $23.10 /FOOT $19.25 /FOOT

30" $27.00 /FOOT $3.50 /FOOT $34.20 /FOOT $27.82 /[FOOT

36" $37.80 /[FOOT $47.55 /[FOOT $51.70 /FOOT $42.55 /FOOT

42" $53.90 /FOOT $59.30 /FOOT $65.00 /FOOT $53.89 /FOOT

48" $61.50 /FOOT $75.25 /[FOOT $79.20 /FOOT $64.96 /FOOT

15" Arch  No Bid /FOOT $23.50 /FOOT $36.00 /FOOT No Bid /FOOT

18" Arch $18.00 /FOOT $26.90 /FOOT $31.00 /FOOT No Bid /FOOT

24"Arch $27.00 /FOOT $37.55 /[FOOT $35.00 /FOOT No Bid /FOOT

30" Arch $39.00 /FOOT $45.10 /FOOT $46.75 /FOOT No Bid /FOOT

36" Arch $56.50 /FOOT $61.90 /FOOT $64.00 /FOOT No Bid /FOOT

42" Arch $73.60 /FOOT $83.50 /FOOT $84.90 /FOOT No Bid /FOOT

48" Arch $90.50 /FOOT $106.30 /FOOT $103.00 /FOOT No Bid /FOOT

CONCRETE BLOCKS: Conway Block 2015 LOW BID
STANDARD WEIGHT CONCRETE BLOCKS (8"x8"x16") $1.45 /EA. $1.57 [EA.

RETAINING WALL BLOCKS(6"x16"x12") $5.36 /EA. $5.72 [EA.
RETAINING WALL BLOCKS(8"x18"x12") $5.50 /EA. $5.84 [EA.

CONCRETE WORK (MATERIALS FURNISHED BY CITY):

WK Contractors LASKER BROTHERS 2015 LOW BID

4" High x 2' Wide ROLL CURB & GUTTER $4.95 /FOOT $5.50 /FOOT $4.45 [FOOT

6"High x 1.5' Wide UPRIGHT CURB & GUTTER $4.95 /FOOT $6.00 /FOOT $4.95 /FOOT

6"High x 2' Wide UPRIGHT CURB & GUTTER $4.95 /S.F. $6.00 /S.F. $1.25 /S.F.

FORM POUR AND FINISH SIDEWALK $1.50 /S.F. $1.25 /S.F. No Bid IS.F.

CONCRETE PAVEMENT REPAIR $10.00 /S.Y. No Bid /8.Y. NO BID /S.Y.

REMOVAL OF UNSUITABLE SUBGRADE $6.00 /C.Y. NO BID IC.Y. NO BID IC.Y.

PLACE AND SHAPE STONE BACKFILL $6.50 /C.Y. NO BID IC.Y. NO BID IC.Y.

PAVEMENT MARKING
Ark. Line Marking Time Striping

4" White Refl. Paint $0.50 /FOOT $0.20 /FOOT

4" Yellow Refl. Paint $0.50 /FOOT $0.20 /FOOT

6" White Refl. Paint $0.50 /FOOT $0.65 /FOOT

6" Yellow Refl. Paint $0.50 /FOOT $0.65 /FOOT

Min. Charge per Project $2,500.00 /Project $6,000.00 /Project

GASOLINE & DIESEL

REG. UNLEADED GAS - No Ethanol Coulson Oil Heritage Petroleum, LLC M.M. SATTERFIELD OIL Retif Oil & Fuel 2015 LOW |
Posted Price 12-14-15 $1.5598 /GAL. $2.0409 /GAL. $1.6437 /GAL. $1.6624 /GAL. $1.9503
BID AMOUNT FOR DELIVERY $0.1150 /GAL. $0.1199 /GAL. $0.1250 /GAL. $0.2500 /GAL. $0.0625
TOTAL BASED ON 12-14-15 Posted $1.6748 /GAL. $2.1608 /GAL. $1.7687 /GAL. $1.9124 /GAL. $2.0128

REG. UNLEADED GAS - 10% Max.Ethanol
Posted Price 12-14-15 $1.2287 /GAL. $1.3248 /GAL. $1.3229 /GAL. $1.3097 /GAL. $1.7532
BID AMOUNT FOR DELIVERY $0.1150 /GAL. $0.1199 /GAL. $0.1250 /GAL. $0.2500 /GAL. $0.0625
TOTAL BASED ON 12-14-15 Posted $1.3437 /GAL. $1.4487 /GAL. $1.4479 /GAL. $1.5597 /GAL. $1.8157

Diesel - 5% Max BioDiesel
Posted Price 12-14-15 $1.0800 /GAL. $1.1979 /GAL. $1.1105 /GAL. $1.1941 /GAL. $2.1461
BID AMOUNT FOR DELIVERY $0.1150 /GAL. $0.1199 /GAL. $0.1250 /GAL. $0.2500 /GAL. $0.0650

TOTAL BASED ON 12-14-15 Posted $1.1950 /GAL. $1.3178 /GAL. $1.2355 /GAL. $1.4441 /GAL. $2.2111


frogers
Highlight


City of Conway — Annual Bid, Pavement Marking
Bid Number: 2016-07
Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, December 15*, 2015
City Hall, Downstairs Conference Room @ 10:00am

Authorized Agent Bidding on this project:

Arkansas Line. Marking LLC

Company Name- '

NVidhael Gallin

Company Representative Name

ALY Jp——

Repr’esentative's Si%ture Date
\O5Q4 Dher Ad crlne Markvig@aol o
Address Email Address’
Litle Aok ner. 13300
City State Zip
Pbl-B8R-565 501-888—-1080
Telephone Number Fax Number

Unsigned bids will be rejected:

City Hall 1201 Oak Street, Conway, AR 72034 501.450.6110




City of Conway
Office of the Mayor

Mayor Tab Townsell

www.cityofconway.orq

INVITATION
TO THE VENDOR ADDRESSED:

Bidders are invited to furnish the items listed herein in accordance with the terms and conditions
attached. Sealed bids must be in the Office of the Mayor; no later than 10:00am, Tuesday, December
15", 2015 at which time all bids will be opened and read in the Downstairs Conference Room in City
Hall. Successful bidders will receive purchase order, within 30 days after City Council approval, if
necessary. Unsigned bids will be rejected.

Invitation to Bid No. 2016-07
Pavement Markings Annual Bid

NAME OF BIDDER ﬁn’kaﬂ\% Line tﬂ&v-kioﬂg oholl X

Bid for pavement marking to be completed in 2016 calendar year:

Installation and Materials shall be in accordance with Section 718 - Reflectorized Paint
Pavement Marking of the Arkansas 2014 Standard Specifications for Highway Construction.

1. Refl. Paint Pavement Marking, White (4”) perlineal ft.  $ 42 SZZ

Approximate Quantity: 30,000’

2. Refl. Paint Pavement Marking, Yellow (4”) per lineal ft. S 0@
Approximate Quantity: 25,000’

3. Refl. Paint Pavement Marking, White (6”) perlineal ft. S (2' sSZ

Approximate Quantity: 5,000’

4. Refl. Paint Pavement Marking, Yellow (6”) perlineal ft.  § (Q..s 2 2

Approximate Quantity: 1,000’

o A 0_.
*  Minimum Charge per project/call out each S 7?@0 o

City Hall 1201 Oak Street, Conway, AR 72034 501.450.6110




City of Conway
Office of the Mayor

Mayor Tab Townsell

www.cityofconway.orq

INVITATION
TO THE VENDOR ADDRESSED:

Bidders are invited to furnish the items listed herein in accordance with the terms and conditions
attached. Sealed bids must be in the Office of the Mayor; no later than 10:00am, Tuesday, December
15, 2015 at which time all bids will be opened and read in the Downstairs Conference Room in City
Hall. Successful bidders will receive purchase order, within 30 days after City Council approval, if
necessary. Unsigned bids will be rejected.

Invitation to Bid No. 2016-07
Pavement Markings Annual Bid

NAME OF BIDDER__ | i e ST - QS Inc
Bid for pavement marking to be completed in 2016 calendar year:

Installation and Materials shall be in accordance with Section 718 - Reflectorized Paint
Pavement Marking of the Arkansas 2014 Standard Specifications for Highway Construction.

1. Refl. Paint Pavement Marking, White (4”) perlineal ft.  § OG Pl
Approximate Quantity: 30,000

2. Refl. Paint Pavement Marking, Yellow (4”) perlineal ft. § O o 2.0
Approximate Quantity: 25,000

3. Refl. Paint Pavement Marking, White (6”) perlineal ft. S C) - 4 S_—
Approximate Quantity: 5,000’

4. Refl. Paint Pavement Marking, Yellow (6”) perlinealft. S O o é> o5
Approximate Quantity: 1,000’

*  Minimum Charge per project/call out each S é/ OO0, s

City Hall 1201 Oak Street, Conway, AR 72034 501.450.6110




City of Conway — Annual Bid, Pavement Marking
Bid Number: 2016-07
Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, December 15, 2015
City Hall, Downstairs Conference Room @ 10:00am

Authorized Agent Bidding on this project:

T-l ne S+ f\)\_f\);/)o, . I/\ €.

Compény Name

:S—O,Nr\ _7’;3 L S Q,mer

Company Representative Name

(2-9-1S"
Representative’s Signature Date
F,ol 60 X 12/2 é\ _}‘I'b n @)‘ttu%é §7Lr‘\“/\ ;N}.(Cli/\
Address Email Address /

Van PBuren AR ‘729.5 F.

City State Zip

Y79-474-64s 2 Y79-914- 049 yg

Telephone Number

Fax Number

Unsigned bids will be rejected:

City Hall 1201 Oak Street, Conway, AR 72034 501.450.6110




