City of Conway, Arkansas Office of the Ma)’Of' Number of Bids Received - 3

Mayor’s Office : 'e) d by: Ronnie Hall
1201 Oak Street . Clt)’ of (:.onway pened By Honnie T2
Conway, AR 72032 Bid Tabulation Sheet
501.450.6110 .

WWW.Clt'YOfconway.Org

Bid Number: 2016-01 — Annual Bid_Gravel

Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, December 15t, 2015

Bidder’s Name Crush Stone FOB (Plant _ )
Location) Crush Stone (Delivered) Ballast Stone Stone Backfill Riprap

Rogers Group $8.56 $13.10 $13.64 $13.39 $20.60
Webco $7.56 $13.10 $13.75 $12.99 $18.62
Hamilton Aggregates $8.65 $13.33 $14.41 $13.33 $20.95

Bid Winner: Rogers Group & Webco (Highlighted in RED)

Bid Tabulations Approval Date: December 2214, 2015

For additional information regarding this bid; please contact Finley Vinson @ finley.vinson@cityofconway.org or 501.450.6165.


mailto:finley.vinson@cityofconway.org
http://www.cityofconway.org/

CITY OF CONWAY

SUMMARY OF ANNUAL BIDS FOR STREET DEPARTMENT TYPE WORK
FOR YEAR 2016

Bids Opened December 15, 2015

GRAVEL ROGERS GROUP WEBCO Hamilton Aggregates 2015 LOW BID
CRUSHED STONE FOB PLANT $8.56 /TON (Gbr) $7.56 /TON(EI Paso $8.65 /TON $8.05 /TON
CRUSHED STONE DELIVERED TO STREET DEPT. $13.10 /TON $13.10 /TON $13.33 /TON $12.57 /TON
BALLAST STONE DELIVERED TO STREET DEPT. $13.64 /TON $13.75 /TON $14.41 /TON $13.75 /TON
STONE BACKFILL DELIVERED TO STREET DEPT. $13.39 /TON $12.99 /TON $13.33 /TON $12.99 /TON
RIPRAP DELIVERED TO STREET DEPARTMENT $20.60 /TON $18.62 /TON $ 20.95 /TON $ 18.62 /TON

CONCRETE MALLARD ARGOS 2015 LOW BID
CLASS A CONCRETE $92.55 /C.Y. $93.52 /C.Y. $84.43 /C.Y.

CLASS S CONCRETE $99.05 /C.Y. $100.05 /C.Y. $87.00 /C.Y.
1% ADDED CALCIUM $4.00 /C.Y. $5.25 /C.Y. $4.00 /C.Y.

CONCRETE PIPE: SIZE Scurlock Forterra Pipe & Precast Drainage Pipe, LLC 2015 LOW BID

12" $8.30 /FOOT $9.90 /FOOT $10.67 /FOOT $8.15 /FOOT

15" $11.00 /FOOT $12.10 /FOOT $13.20 /FOOT $11.35 /FOOT

18" $11.50 /FOOT $14.70 /FOOT $16.00 /FOOT $13.16 /FOOT

24" $18.75 /[FOOT $23.30 /FOOT $23.10 /FOOT $19.25 /FOOT

30" $27.00 /FOOT $3.50 /FOOT $34.20 /FOOT $27.82 /[FOOT

36" $37.80 /[FOOT $47.55 /[FOOT $51.70 /FOOT $42.55 /FOOT

42" $53.90 /FOOT $59.30 /FOOT $65.00 /FOOT $53.89 /FOOT

48" $61.50 /FOOT $75.25 /[FOOT $79.20 /FOOT $64.96 /FOOT

15" Arch  No Bid /FOOT $23.50 /FOOT $36.00 /FOOT No Bid /FOOT

18" Arch $18.00 /FOOT $26.90 /FOOT $31.00 /FOOT No Bid /FOOT

24"Arch $27.00 /FOOT $37.55 /[FOOT $35.00 /FOOT No Bid /FOOT

30" Arch $39.00 /FOOT $45.10 /FOOT $46.75 /FOOT No Bid /FOOT

36" Arch $56.50 /FOOT $61.90 /FOOT $64.00 /FOOT No Bid /FOOT

42" Arch $73.60 /FOOT $83.50 /FOOT $84.90 /FOOT No Bid /FOOT

48" Arch $90.50 /FOOT $106.30 /FOOT $103.00 /FOOT No Bid /FOOT

CONCRETE BLOCKS: Conway Block 2015 LOW BID
STANDARD WEIGHT CONCRETE BLOCKS (8"x8"x16") $1.45 /EA. $1.57 [EA.

RETAINING WALL BLOCKS(6"x16"x12") $5.36 /EA. $5.72 [EA.
RETAINING WALL BLOCKS(8"x18"x12") $5.50 /EA. $5.84 [EA.

CONCRETE WORK (MATERIALS FURNISHED BY CITY):

WK Contractors LASKER BROTHERS 2015 LOW BID

4" High x 2' Wide ROLL CURB & GUTTER $4.95 /FOOT $5.50 /FOOT $4.45 [FOOT

6"High x 1.5' Wide UPRIGHT CURB & GUTTER $4.95 /FOOT $6.00 /FOOT $4.95 /FOOT

6"High x 2' Wide UPRIGHT CURB & GUTTER $4.95 /S.F. $6.00 /S.F. $1.25 /S.F.

FORM POUR AND FINISH SIDEWALK $1.50 /S.F. $1.25 /S.F. No Bid IS.F.

CONCRETE PAVEMENT REPAIR $10.00 /S.Y. No Bid /8.Y. NO BID /S.Y.

REMOVAL OF UNSUITABLE SUBGRADE $6.00 /C.Y. NO BID IC.Y. NO BID IC.Y.

PLACE AND SHAPE STONE BACKFILL $6.50 /C.Y. NO BID IC.Y. NO BID IC.Y.

PAVEMENT MARKING
Ark. Line Marking Time Striping

4" White Refl. Paint $0.50 /FOOT $0.20 /FOOT

4" Yellow Refl. Paint $0.50 /FOOT $0.20 /FOOT

6" White Refl. Paint $0.50 /FOOT $0.65 /FOOT

6" Yellow Refl. Paint $0.50 /FOOT $0.65 /FOOT

Min. Charge per Project $2,500.00 /Project $6,000.00 /Project

GASOLINE & DIESEL

REG. UNLEADED GAS - No Ethanol Coulson Oil Heritage Petroleum, LLC M.M. SATTERFIELD OIL Retif Oil & Fuel 2015 LOW |
Posted Price 12-14-15 $1.5598 /GAL. $2.0409 /GAL. $1.6437 /GAL. $1.6624 /GAL. $1.9503
BID AMOUNT FOR DELIVERY $0.1150 /GAL. $0.1199 /GAL. $0.1250 /GAL. $0.2500 /GAL. $0.0625
TOTAL BASED ON 12-14-15 Posted $1.6748 /GAL. $2.1608 /GAL. $1.7687 /GAL. $1.9124 /GAL. $2.0128

REG. UNLEADED GAS - 10% Max.Ethanol
Posted Price 12-14-15 $1.2287 /GAL. $1.3248 /GAL. $1.3229 /GAL. $1.3097 /GAL. $1.7532
BID AMOUNT FOR DELIVERY $0.1150 /GAL. $0.1199 /GAL. $0.1250 /GAL. $0.2500 /GAL. $0.0625
TOTAL BASED ON 12-14-15 Posted $1.3437 /GAL. $1.4487 /GAL. $1.4479 /GAL. $1.5597 /GAL. $1.8157

Diesel - 5% Max BioDiesel
Posted Price 12-14-15 $1.0800 /GAL. $1.1979 /GAL. $1.1105 /GAL. $1.1941 /GAL. $2.1461
BID AMOUNT FOR DELIVERY $0.1150 /GAL. $0.1199 /GAL. $0.1250 /GAL. $0.2500 /GAL. $0.0650

TOTAL BASED ON 12-14-15 Posted $1.1950 /GAL. $1.3178 /GAL. $1.2355 /GAL. $1.4441 /GAL. $2.2111


frogers
Highlight


City of Conway — Gravel Annual Bid
Bid Number: 2016-01
Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, December 15%, 2015
City Hall, Downstairs Conference Room @ 10:00am

Aggregate Base Course, Class 7: g Y L
FOB Plant, Aggregate Base Course, Class 7 Perton $ T

Plant location: (=rCen Hriev

Aggregate Base Course, Class 7, Material Delivered to

Conway Street Department Yard @ 100 East Robins or to city /3 /0
construction sites within the city limits. Perton $

Ballast Stone (1-1/4" to %”), Material Delivered to 4
Conway Street Department Yard @ 100 East Robins or to city /3 é
construction site within the city limits. Perton $ —_
Stone Backfill: Stone Backfill Material Delivered to Conway Street 3 3?
Department Yard @ 100 East Robins Perton $ / ’_
Riprap: Riprap Material Delivered to Conway Street é )
Department Yard @ 100 East Robins Perton $ /20 =

Unsigned bids will be rejected:

Authorized Agent Bidding on this project:

/40?225 Croup Tpc

Cormpany Name

MI\Ké Kﬂl\q/)%

Company Representative Name

Y1107, Y7 A

Compa ny Rey:%gentatlve Signature

223 Front 3F fonwch Lr 72032

Address: City statd Zip

50/-339-652/ 40/-334-8/440

Telephone Number Fax Number

) ‘ rpqers ug /e, . Com

Email Address Date

City Hall 1201 Oak Street, Conway, AR 72034 [501.450.6110]




City of Conway — Gravel Annual Bid
Bid Number: 2016-01
Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, December 15, 2015
City Hall, Downstairs Conference Room @ 10:00am

Aggregate Base Course, Class 7:
FOB Plant, Aggregate Base Course, Class 7 Perton S 7 5"(0
Plant location: g [ aso 4@—

Aggregate Base Course, Class 7, Material Delivered to
Conway Street Department Yard @ 100 East Robins or to city
construction sites within the city limits. Perton $ / 3 . 1O

Ballast Stone (1-1/4” to %”), Material Delivered to
Conway Street Department Yard @ 100 East Robins or to city {
construction site within the city limits. Per ton $ I8 ¥

Stone Backfill: Stone Backfill Material Delivered to Conway Street 4q
Department Yard @ 100 East Robins Perton $ / 2.

Riprap: Riprap Material Delivered to Conway Street
Department Yard @ 100 East Robins Perton $ | 8.l 2.

Unsigned bids will be rejected:

Authorized Agent Bidding on this project:

Webco Minin q Tnea.

Company Name

Chacles T~ Weaver

Company Representative Name

(L S L

Company Representative Signature

Po Bsy o E£|Rsc AR 72045

Address: City State Zip

501-T19L - 230 50]-719L-2372.

Telephone Number Fax Number

Webeo @—\—cworks. net™ 12612015

Email Address /Date /

City Hall 1201 Oak Street, Conway, AR 72034 [501.450.6110]




City of Conway — Gravel Annual Bid
Bid Number: 2016-01
Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, December 15, 2015
City Hall, Downstairs Conference Room @ 10:00am

Aggregate Base Course, Class 7: .
FOB Plant, Aggreg Bas§Course, Class 7 ] Perton $ ? 3 /\[\'L
Plant location: Y

Aggregate Base Course, Class 7, Material Delivered to
Conway Street Department Yard @ 100 East Robins or to city
construction sites within the city limits. Perton $ \ % .

Ballast Stone (1-1/4” to %”), Material Delivered to 5
Conway Street Department Yard @ 100 East Robins or to city ()\ DD/
construction site within the city limits. Perton $ \

Stone Backfill: Stone Backfill Material Delivered to Conway Street 13-
Department Yard @ 100 East Robins Perton $ Q?&

Riprap: Riprap Material Delivered to Conway Street " 5/
Department Yard @ 100 East Robins Per ton $ <>{) &o L[\L

Unsigned bids will be rejected:

Authorized Agent Bidding on this project:

A e e Mo«& aates

Com ny Na%le

\\QS\\L S

Company Representative Name

C?R\LS\AL \%\J\\

Compa nyﬁepresentatlve Signature

2.0, oo Al \)\m\\\,m A¢ 'ﬂa\\ZiD

Address: City \state

So\- Ang- ADAS _ 5D-R43- (0453

Telephone Number Fax Number

AW\o

S.0om

Email Address

City Hall 1201 Oak Street, Conway, AR 72034 [501.450.6110]




