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Number of Bids Received - 
Opened by: Jamie Brice








	
Bid Number: 2021-04 – Annual Bid Concrete Work New Construction

Bid Opening Date: Thursday, December 17, 2020 @ 10:00am 


	





Bidder’s Name 
	



4” x 2’ Wide Roll Curb & Gutter -per lineal foot
	



6” High x 1.5 Wide Upright Curb & Gutter – Per lineal foot

	



6” High  x 2’ High Upright Curb & Gutter – Per lineal foot 
	



Inlet Top – Each
	



Inlet Throat
-Each
	



Inlet Barrel - Each
	



Concrete Curb Inlet 4’ Extension
	



Sidewalk/Driveway
Variable widths (est. 3000 sq. yd.)
Per sq. yd.
	



Concrete Pavement Avg 8” Variable widths (est 3000 SY)

	



Concrete Pavement, Undercut of Unsuitable Material Per cu. Yd.


	Lasker
	5.00
	5.00
	5.00
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	Evatt Construction
	5.00
	4.50
	5.00
	800.00
	200.00
	800.00
	300.00
	18.00
	18.00
	45.00

	JCI
	5.00
	5.00
	5.00
	800.00
	200.00
	800.00
	300.00
	18.00
	18.00
	20.00

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	



For additional information regarding this bid; please contact Finley Vinson @ finley.vinson@cityofconway.org or 501.450.6165.


	
Bid Number: 2021-04 – Annual Bid Concrete Work Remove/Replace


Bid Opening Date: Thursday, December 17, 2020 @ 10:00am 



	





Bidder’s Name 
	



4” x 2’ Wide Roll Curb & Gutter -per lineal foot
	



6” High x 1.5 Wide Upright Curb & Gutter – Per lineal foot

	



6” High  x 2’ High Upright Curb & Gutter – Per lineal foot 
	



Inlet Top – Each
	



Inlet Throat
-Each
	



Inlet Barrel - Each
	



Concrete Curb Inlet 4’ Extension
	



Sidewalk/Driveway
Variable widths (est. 3000 sq. yd.)
Per sq. yd.
	



Concrete Pavement Avg 8” Variable widths (est 3000 SY)

	



Concrete Pavement, Undercut of Unsuitable Material Per cu. Yd.


	Lasker
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	Evatt Construction
	15.00
	15.00
	15.00
	1600.00
	400.00
	1600.00
	600.00
	60.00
	120.00
	45.00

	JCI
	15.00
	15.00
	15.00
	1500.00
	400.00
	1500.00
	500.00
	50.00
	60.00
	20.00
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